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Quaint cottage meets tropical paradise in this delightful consideration of the homes, gardens, and interiors of
"The Grove." Coconut Grove is a seaside hideaway filled with modest homes and charming cottages that
have been nurtured, preserved, and artfully updated for today. Houses washed with white set amidst
abundant gardens recall Eden. Irregular rooflines fitted with earthy red tile emerge playfully from an
abundance of bright bougainvillea and graceful palms. Fountains splash playfully within cozy courtyards.
Within these homes—small cracker cottages, stone bungalows, Mediterranean casitas, and Caribbean-styled
ranches—light, bright colors and cool tile floors offer solace from the blazing afternoon rays of the sun. A
haven for those drawn to eclectic architecture and a welcoming atmosphere, the cottages of Coconut Grove
are both the realization of the tropical domestic dream and an expression of a lifestyle marked by quiet joys.
Here, for the first time in brilliant new photography specifically commissioned for the book, are the finest
and most intriguing cottages of this special place—an unprecedented tour and invitation given by
architecture authority and Miami resident Beth Dunlop and Coconut Grove-based photographer Claudia
Uribe.
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From reader reviews:

Terry Tyrrell:

Here thing why this kind of The Tropical Cottage: At Home in Coconut Grove are different and dependable
to be yours. First of all studying a book is good but it really depends in the content of it which is the content
is as delicious as food or not. The Tropical Cottage: At Home in Coconut Grove giving you information
deeper as different ways, you can find any e-book out there but there is no publication that similar with The
Tropical Cottage: At Home in Coconut Grove. It gives you thrill reading through journey, its open up your
personal eyes about the thing that will happened in the world which is maybe can be happened around you.
You can easily bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your approach home by train. In case you are
having difficulties in bringing the paper book maybe the form of The Tropical Cottage: At Home in Coconut
Grove in e-book can be your option.

Megan Martelli:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading
book therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of
new information. When you read a book you will get new information simply because book is one of a
number of ways to share the information or their idea. Second, studying a book will make anyone more
imaginative. When you reading through a book especially hype book the author will bring you to imagine the
story how the personas do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other individuals. When you
read this The Tropical Cottage: At Home in Coconut Grove, you could tells your family, friends along with
soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a book.

Graciela Johnson:

Often the book The Tropical Cottage: At Home in Coconut Grove has a lot details on it. So when you make
sure to read this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was published by the very famous author. This
articles author makes some research ahead of write this book. This book very easy to read you can find the
point easily after reading this book.

Sandra Spier:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you are in the book store? Try to
pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't ascertain book by its handle may doesn't
work is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not as fantastic as in the outside seem
likes. Maybe you answer is usually The Tropical Cottage: At Home in Coconut Grove why because the
fantastic cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or content is
actually fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly assist you to pick up
this book.
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