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Cosmology in Gauge Field Theory and String Theory focuses on the cosmological implications of the gauge
theories of particle physics and of string theory.

The book first examines the universe's series of phase transitions in which the successive gauge symmetries
of the higher-temperature phase were spontaneously broken after the big bang, discussing relics of these
phase transitions, more generic relics (baryons, neutrinos, axions), and supersymmetric particles (neutralinos
and gravitinos). The author next studies supersymmetric theory, supergravity theory, and the constraints on
the underlying field theory of the universe's inflationary era. The book concludes with a discussion of black
hole solutions of the supergravity theory that approximates string theory at low energies and the insight that
string theory affords into the microscopic origin of the Bekenstein-Hawking entropy.

Cosmology in Gauge Field Theory and String Theory provides a modern introduction to these important
problems from a particle physicist's perspective. It is intended as an introductory textbook for a first course
on the subject at a graduate level.
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From reader reviews:

Christine Frazier:

Book is usually written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important thing to bring us around the world.
Next to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A guide Cosmology in Gauge Field Theory and
String Theory (Graduate Student Series in Physics) will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel
much more confidence if you can know about almost everything. But some of you think in which open or
reading some sort of book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why they could be thought
like that? Have you trying to find best book or suitable book with you?

Percy Brown:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray anyone, why because this Cosmology in Gauge Field Theory and
String Theory (Graduate Student Series in Physics) publication written by well-known writer who really
knows well how to make book which might be understand by anyone who else read the book. Written
throughout good manner for you, dripping every ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your own
personal hunger then you still skepticism Cosmology in Gauge Field Theory and String Theory (Graduate
Student Series in Physics) as good book not just by the cover but also by content. This is one e-book that can
break don't ascertain book by its cover, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on
your looking at sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Frank Bullard:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information
quicker to share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspapers,
book, and soon. You can see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The particular book
that recommended for you is Cosmology in Gauge Field Theory and String Theory (Graduate Student Series
in Physics) this publication consist a lot of the information in the condition of this world now. This particular
book was represented how does the world has grown up. The words styles that writer use for explain it is
easy to understand. Often the writer made some analysis when he makes this book. That's why this book
suitable all of you.

Jason Rickman:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by simply watching television
programs or just lying down on the bed? Do you need something new? This Cosmology in Gauge Field
Theory and String Theory (Graduate Student Series in Physics) can be the solution, oh how comes? The new
book you know. You are therefore out of date, spending your time by reading in this fresh era is common not
a nerd activity. So what these guides have than the others?
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