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Every love story should have its own song... A childhood promise has Chance Walker picking up a guitar
once again. Sure, he's been busy growing up, finishing college, and even law school. He made a promise to
his dying mother and he’s determined to keep it. While his guitar playing dreams were big when he was a
kid, his skill is rusty and he hires Erin Michaelson to bring music back into his life. Not only is she
incredibly talented, she's one of the sexiest women he’s ever met. It's hard to focus on correct finger position
when her sweet scent threatens to drive him out of his mind. Less than twenty-four hours after his first lesson
he sees her again, but this time she’s on stage using another name and seducing an entire audience of men.
He played the gentleman card once, and it got him nowhere. This time, all bets are off and he’ll do whatever
it takes to keep her. A single, sizzling backstage kiss will change both of their lives forever, because Chance
soon realizes that Erin is not just an itch, she’s an obsession that he refuses to live without. Erin Michaelson
spends her days teaching guitar and her nights on stage as her sexy alter-ego, Eva James. Music is her dream,
her passion. All she wants is to say goodbye to a lifetime of scraping by, working two jobs, and paying for
past mistakes. When a major record label exec hears her band play, she gets her big break. But life can be a
real bitch, and meeting Chance now is just bad timing. Problem #1: The record label wants her to dump her
band and move to L.A. Problem #2: She hadn’t counted on Chance Walker and the scorching heat of that
first kiss. And last but not least is Problem #3: Is Chance really falling in love with the dull guitar teacher, or
is he really just lusting after the sexy Eva James? Will success make all of Erin's dreams come true? Or will
falling in love make them both crash and burn? Crash and Burn is a scorching hot, contemporary, new adult
romance of 58,000 words. The story contains explicit love scenes and is intended for an adult audience.
Coming soon, fall in love with the other Walker brothers in Alone With You (Feb 2016), Up All Night (Mar
2016) and Make Me Forget (April 2016). For more details visit Michele's website at michelecallahan.com
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From reader reviews:

Noah Cale:

Why don't make it to become your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite e-book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your long lasting problem;
you can add your knowledge by the publication entitled Crash and Burn (Love You Like A Love Song)
(Volume 1). Try to the actual book Crash and Burn (Love You Like A Love Song) (Volume 1) as your close
friend. It means that it can being your friend when you sense alone and beside associated with course make
you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book makes you more confidence
because you can know anything by the book. So , let us make new experience in addition to knowledge with
this book.

Dominick Carter:

What do you regarding book? It is not important with you? Or just adding material when you really need
something to explain what your own problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy individual? If you
don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have time? What
did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They should answer that question simply because
just their can do that will. It said that about reserve. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is proper.
Because start from on jardín de infancia until university need this specific Crash and Burn (Love You Like A
Love Song) (Volume 1) to read.

Peggy Witzel:

The particular book Crash and Burn (Love You Like A Love Song) (Volume 1) will bring you to the new
experience of reading any book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. In the event you try to
find new book to read, this book very ideal to you. The book Crash and Burn (Love You Like A Love Song)
(Volume 1) is much recommended to you to read. You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so
you can more easily to read the book.

Herman Hernandez:

Within this era which is the greater man or who has ability to do something more are more important than
other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you are related is just
spending your time little but quite enough to get a look at some books. One of many books in the top record
in your reading list is usually Crash and Burn (Love You Like A Love Song) (Volume 1). This book and that
is qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in getting precious person. By looking upwards and
review this publication you can get many advantages.
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