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The puzzles in this book are based on 5 by 5 pandiagonal magic squares. A pandiagonal magic square has 20
sums to the same number. Each row, each column, each of 5 downward diagonals, and each of 5 upward
diagonals sum to the same number, called the magic sum. The four following charts show the 5 rows, the 5
columns, the 5 downward diagonals, and the 5 upward diagonals. The rows, columns, and diagonals will be
illustrated using the following magic square. Incidentally, all entries in this magic square are prime integers.
5 103 16067 19 1493 17 1489 17 101 16063 113 16061 13 1487 13 1483 11 109 16073 11 16069 23 1481 7
107 The 5 rows: 1 1 1 1 1 2 2 2 2 2 3 3 3 3 3 4 4 4 4 4 5 5 5 5 5 The top row sum is 5 + 103 + 16067+19 +
1493 = 17687. The second row sum is 17 + 1489 + 17 + 101 + 16063 = 17687. The third row sum is 113 +
16061 + 13 + 1487 + 13 = 17687. The fourth row sum is 1483 + 11 + 109 + 16073 + 11 = 17687. The fifth
row sum is 16069 + 23 + 1481 + 7 + 107 = 17687. 5 103 16067 19 1493 17 1489 17 101 16063 113 16061
13 1487 13 1483 11 109 16073 11 16069 23 1481 7 107 The 5 columns: 1 2 3 4 5 1 2 3 4 5 1 2 3 4 5 1 2 3 4
5 1 2 3 4 5 The first column sum is 5 + 17 + 113 + 1483 + 16069 = 17687. The second column sum is 103 +
1489 + 16061 + 11 + 23 = 17687. The third column sum is 16067 + 17 + 13 + 109 + 1481 = 17687. The
fourth column sum is 19 + 101 + 1487 + 16073 + 7 = 17687. The fifth column sum is 1493 + 16063 + 13 +
11 + 107 = 17687. Four of the downward diagonals and four of the upward diagonals are broken diagonals.
They wrap around the edges of the square as shown in the following two diagrams. 5 103 16067 19 1493 17
1489 17 101 16063 113 16061 13 1487 13 1483 11 109 16073 11 16069 23 1481 7 107 The 5 downward
diagonals 1 2 3 4 5 5 1 2 3 4 4 5 1 2 3 3 4 5 1 2 2 3 4 5 1 The first downward diagonal sum is 5 + 1489 + 13
+ 16073 + 107 = 17687. The second downward diagonal sum is 103 + 17 + 1487 + 11 + 16069 = 17687. The
third downward diagonal sum is 16067 + 101 + 13 + 1483 + 23 = 17687. The fourth downward diagonal sum
is 19 + 16063 + 113 + 11 + 1481 = 17687. The fifth downward diagonal sum is 1493 + 17 + 16061 + 109 +
7. 5 103 16067 19 1493 17 1489 17 101 16063 113 16061 13 1487 13 1483 11 109 16073 11 16069 23 1481
7 107 The 5 upward diagonals 5 4 3 2 1 4 3 2 1 5 3 2 1 5 4 2 1 5 4 3 1 5 4 3 2 The first upward diagonal sum
is 16069 + 11 + 13 + 101 + 1493 = 17687. The second upward diagonal sum is 1483 + 16061 + 17 + 19 +
107 = 17687. The third upward diagonal sum is 113 + 1489 + 16067 + 19 + 1493 = 17687. The fourth
upward diagonal sum is 17 + 103 + 1481 + 16073 + 13 = 17687. The fifth upward diagonal sum is 5 + 23 +
109 + 1487 + 16063 = 17687. Each puzzle has from 10 to 15 of the solution entries marked out. Your task is
to fill in the marked out numbers to recreate the magic square that has only prime number entries.
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From reader reviews:

Frankie Evans:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be update about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era that is always change and make progress. Some of you
maybe will probably update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice in your case but the
problems coming to anyone is you don't know what type you should start with. This Prime Magic Square
Puzzles: Based on 5 by 5 magic squares with all prime number entries is our recommendation to cause you to
keep up with the world. Why, because this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Teressa Fernandez:

Do you one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold on guys this
specific aren't like that. This Prime Magic Square Puzzles: Based on 5 by 5 magic squares with all prime
number entries book is readable by means of you who hate the straight word style. You will find the info
here are arrange for enjoyable examining experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that
want to deliver to you. The writer associated with Prime Magic Square Puzzles: Based on 5 by 5 magic
squares with all prime number entries content conveys prospect easily to understand by most people. The
printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it just different such as it. So , do you
nevertheless thinking Prime Magic Square Puzzles: Based on 5 by 5 magic squares with all prime number
entries is not loveable to be your top checklist reading book?

Eliseo Watkins:

The reserve with title Prime Magic Square Puzzles: Based on 5 by 5 magic squares with all prime number
entries has a lot of information that you can learn it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This
particular book exist new information the information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of
the world today. That is important to yo7u to find out how the improvement of the world. This particular
book will bring you throughout new era of the internationalization. You can read the e-book in your smart
phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you want.

Thomas Burke:

You will get this Prime Magic Square Puzzles: Based on 5 by 5 magic squares with all prime number entries
by go to the bookstore or Mall. Just simply viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve trouble if you get
difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only by written or printed but
additionally can you enjoy this book simply by e-book. In the modern era including now, you just looking by
your local mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more
information about your guide. It is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are
still up-date. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.
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